
Day 1 

Arrive Dubai 

On arrival at Dubai's International Airport you will be met by Goway's local representative and assisted with your 
transfer to the hotel. 

The rest of the day is at leisure to relax and enjoy the hotel's facilities or begin your exploration of Dubai at your 
own pace. 

Duration 4 Nights 

Accommodation  

JW Marriott Marquis Dubai 

 

Day 2 

Museum of the Future 

Meet your driver and transfer to the Museum of the Future for your timed entry visit. The Museum of the Future 
is the first attraction of its kind. Built to transform the very perception of the future, as we know it, the unique 
structure accommodations several immersive future environments exploring the future of space travel and living, 
climate change and ecology, health and wellness. Rising 77-metres above the ground with an instantly iconic 
exterior, the Museum of the Future is an empowering vision of the future. 

Meal Plan Breakfast 

 

Day 3 

Sunset Desert Safari 

Get ready to experience the desert like never before. Leave the buzzing city behind as you're whisked off to the 
beautiful and peaceful Dubai Desert Conservation Reserve, ready to deliver the best of what the dunes have to 
offer. Enjoy a thrilling dune drive, spotting local wildlife along the way, snap unbeatable photos at sunset, find your 
balance on a camel or a sandboard and have your hands decorated in Henna to help the memories last longer. 

As you reach the magical campsite, you're in for an evening full of awe-inspiring local entertainment and a 
delicious barbeque dinner under the stars, accompanied by your preferred package of adult beverages. Sit back, 
relax and indulge in delectable foods and mesmerizing performances. 

Meal Plan Breakfast and Dinner 

 

Day 4 

Dubai at leisure 

Explore this vibrant city, book an optional excursion or simply relax. 

Meal Plan Breakfast 



Day 5 

Dubai to Male, Maldives 

Following breakfast, you will be transferred to the airport for your flight to Male, Maldives (Flight not included in 
Trip Price). 

You will be met and transferred by seaplane from Velana International Airport to your resort.  The rest of the day is 
at leisure. 

Accommodation: Sun Siyam Iru Fushi 

Meal Plan Full Board 

Duration 7 Nights 

 

Days 6 to 11 

Enjoying Maldives 

Sun Siyam Iru Fushi is located on 52 acres of private island paradise and is famous for continuous white sand 
beach that surrounds the entire island and a house reef rich with marine life. The resort offers deluxe 
accommodations in a variety of Villas and Retreats, 2 pools, 14 top level restaurants and bars, an award winning 
spa and endless amounts of snorkeling, diving, entertainment and activities. Spend your days lounging on the 
beach, exploring the house reef, relaxing by the swimming pool overlooking the beach or taking part in countless 
activities. If you are a diver, expect to see amid the coral reefs in the clear blue waters which abound here, mantas, 
sharks, hammerheads as well as swarms of colourful tropical fish. In fact, there are 200 species of coral and over a 
thousand different species of fish!                                                                                                                                                                        

Meal Plan Full Board 

 

Day 12 

Depart Maldives 

Transfer by seaplane back to Velana International Airport. 

Meal Plan Breakfast 


